
What Virtues Does Stewardship Help To Cultivate? 
Stewardship, a transformative way of life deeply rooted in the Catholic religion, is a 
powerful force that cultivates many virtues. When nurtured, these virtues empower 
individuals, making them feel capable and responsible for fulfilling their calling to care 
responsibly for their faith, creation, and their fellow human beings. With its profound 
transformative power, stewardship develops virtues and allows individuals to be capable 
and responsible. 

Gratitude: Recognizing all things as gifts from God fosters a sense of thankfulness for the 
blessings in one's life and the beauty of creation. 

Responsibility: Understanding that God entrusts humanity with all of the world's creation 
cultivates a duty to care for, protect, and use it wisely. 

Justice: Stewardship plays a crucial role in promoting justice. Recognizing the universal 
destination of goods, fostering fairness in the distribution of resources, and a commitment 
to ensuring that all people have access to what they need to live with dignity. 

Temperance: Stewardship is instrumental in promoting a more temperate way of life. 
Practicing moderation in using material goods can help curb excessive attachment to 
worldly possessions. 

Solidarity, a virtue fostered by stewardship, acknowledges the interconnectedness of all 
people. It promotes a sense of unity and a commitment to working together for the 
common good, especially for the benefit of the poor and vulnerable. This sense of unity 
makes us all part of a larger community, connected by our shared responsibility, fostering a 
feeling of belonging and unity. 

Prudence, a gift from the Holy Spirit and a virtue cultivated by stewardship, is about 
making wise and practical decisions. It ensures sustainability and long-term availability for 
future generations. This responsibility empowers us to impact the world around us 
positively. 

 

Faith, Hope, and Charity are three distinct theological Christian virtues essential to a 
Christian's life. Let us examine them individually. 

  



How Does Stewardship Relate to Faith? 
The Catholic tradition intrinsically links stewardship to faith, particularly within. It is more 
than just responsible management; it's a lived expression of one's relationship with God 
and the world. 

Here's how stewardship relates to faith: 

Recognition of God as Creator: Stewardship begins with the belief that God created the 
world and everything in it, including us, our loved ones, and those we struggle to love. This 
recognition leads to profound awe, deep gratitude, and a strong responsibility towards this 
magnificent creation. 

Humans as Stewards: Faith teaches that God entrusted the earth to humanity to care for 
it, cultivate it, and use its resources wisely. We are not owners but stewards, accountable 
to God for managing these gifts. 

Moral Obligation: Catholic social teaching emphasizes that caring for creation is not 
merely an option but a moral obligation rooted in our faith. This obligation extends to 
protecting the Deposit of Faith, our fellow man, and the environment, allowing the Holy 
Spirit to move us, conserving resources, and ensuring a safe and hospitable world for 
future generations. 

Love for God and Neighbor: Stewardship expresses love for God and neighbor. By caring 
for creation and those in it, we respect the Creator and ensure that all people, especially 
the poor, have the resources they need to live with dignity. 

Ecological Conversion: Pope Francis describes embracing stewardship as an 'ecological 
conversion,' a term that may be unfamiliar to some. This concept refers to a profound 
change in our relationship with the world, where our encounter with Jesus Christ 
transforms our understanding and care for the environment. This conversion inspires 
creativity and enthusiasm in addressing the world's problems and offering ourselves to 
God. 

Religious Respect: Caring for the environment stems from a deep religious instinct 
implanted within us by God. It involves cultivating a 'religious respect for the integrity of 
creation,' a term that may need further explanation. This respect means recognizing the 
inherent value and beauty of all God has made and understanding our role as stewards to 
protect and preserve it as a gift and privilege. 

Bearing Witness: By practicing responsible stewardship, we witness the "good news" of 
Creation, the Gospel, and Redemption, leading others to Christ. 



In essence, stewardship is the practical outworking of faith, demonstrating our love for God 
and neighbor through responsible care for creation and the just use of its resources. It is a 
call to live in harmony with God's design and to work toward a world where all can flourish. 

  



How Does Stewardship Relate to Hope? 
Stewardship and hope are deeply intertwined in Catholic thought, reinforcing each other in 
a dynamic relationship. Stewardship, understood as the responsible care for our faith, 
creation, and fellow human beings, provides a concrete way to live out hope. As a 
theological virtue, hope is not just optimism or wishful thinking but a confident expectation 
grounded in God's faithfulness. It inspires and sustains our commitment to stewardship, 
filling us with motivation and optimism for the future. 

Hope as a Foundation for Stewardship 

As one of the three theological virtues, hope is a gift from God that enables us to desire the 
Kingdom of heaven and eternal life, placing our trust in Christ's promises. This hope is not 
merely wishful thinking but a confident expectation grounded in God's faithfulness. It 
provides a positive outlook, making it possible to live in the present. 

Motivation for Action: Hope inspires us to take action in the present, knowing that our 
efforts can contribute to a better future. As Pope Benedict XVI stated, "earthly activity, 
when inspired and sustained by charity, contributes to the building of the universal city of 
God." 

Safeguarding Creation: Hope motivates us to safeguard creation, recognizing the planet's 
future and entrusting it to new generations. This stewardship involves courageous 
decisions to protect nature's delicate balance and promote a more just and sustainable 
world. 

Moral Obligation: As stewards called by God, we have a moral obligation to protect all His 
gifts for future generations. This sense of responsibility fuels hope for a world where people 
respect and protect all creation. 

Stewardship as an Expression of Hope 

Stewardship, in turn, becomes a tangible expression of our hope. By actively caring for 
creation and working towards a more just world, we demonstrate our belief in a brighter 
future and our commitment to making that future a reality. 

Building a Better World: Stewardship involves creating a more just, sober society where 
all may enjoy God's gifts. This active participation in building up the Kingdom on Earth 
embodies hope. 

Overcoming Pessimism: Stewardship offers a concrete way to combat despair and 
embrace a hopeful vision in an uncertain and pessimistic world. By taking responsibility for 



our actions and working towards positive change, we counter the temptation of 
hopelessness. 

Ecological Conversion: Embracing stewardship leads to an 'ecological conversion,' a term 
coined by Pope Francis, which refers to a profound change in our relationship with the 
world. Inspired by our encounter with Jesus Christ, this transformation motivates us to 
address the world's problems creatively and enthusiastically. It is an act of hope, 
demonstrating our belief in the possibility of healing and renewal and our commitment to 
building a more just and sustainable world. 

In summary, stewardship and hope are mutually reinforcing. Hope provides the vision and 
motivation for responsible action. At the same time, stewardship offers a concrete way to 
live out that hope and to build a more just and sustainable world for present and future 
generations. 

How Does Stewardship Relate to Charity? 
Stewardship and charity are closely related concepts in Catholic teaching, from 
recognizing God's gifts to a call to love and serve others. Here's how they relate: 

Stewardship as a Foundation for Charity: Stewardship provides the foundation for charity 
by recognizing that all we have is a gift from God, not something we own absolutely. This 
understanding leads to a sense of responsibility to manage these gifts wisely and use them 
for the benefit of others, which is the essence of charity. 

Charity as an Expression of Stewardship: Charity is a key expression of stewardship. It 
involves sharing our time, talents, and resources with those in need, reflecting God's love 
and generosity. As Pope Francis stated, there is no alternative to charity, and those who put 
themselves in the service of others, even when they don't know it, are those who love God. 

Interconnectedness: Stewardship calls for the responsible use of resources, while charity 
directs us to share those resources with others, especially the poor and vulnerable. This 
interconnectedness of stewardship and charity fosters a sense of unity and shared 
responsibility among us, ensuring that resources are available and put into action for the 
good of others. 

Beyond Mere Assistance: Christian charity, rooted in stewardship, goes beyond simply 
providing material assistance. It involves heartfelt concern and dedication to others, 
enabling them to experience the richness of their humanity. It's not just about extending a 
hand in times of need but a vocation to put one's entire life at the service of others, growing 
in love each day. 



The Church's Role: The Church is crucial in promoting stewardship and charity among its 
members. It does so by encouraging support of its ministries, such as the Diocesan Annual 
Appeal, which provides resources for various charitable activities. By witnessing daily 
charity, Christians help others recognize and sense God's love, fostering a culture of 
stewardship and charity within the community. 

In essence, stewardship is the responsible management of God's gifts, while charity is the 
loving distribution of those gifts to meet the needs of others. They are two sides of the same 
coin, essential for living a Christian life of love and service. 
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